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VW Polo (9N) 1.4 TDI  
  
Bulb replacement   
To replace the bulbs in the above-mentioned vehicle, 
proceed as follows: 
Driver side: 
 
Low beam light: 

- Switch off the ignition. 
- To have more room for installation, loosen the battery 

cover and the fuse holder beneath it from the 
attachment plates and push them a little to the left (see 
Fig. 1) 

- Pull the rubber cap (low beam light) off the headlight 
housing. 

- Pull the plug-type connection off the bulb and turn the 
attachment ring anti-clockwise (see Fig. 2). 

- Pull the bulb out of the reflector and replace it. 
 
Indicator light: 

- Turn the cover cap anti-clockwise and remove it (see 
Fig. 3). 

- Grasp the socket of the indicator bulb, remove it with 
the bulb and replace the bulb. 

 
High beam and parking light: 

- The battery has to be removed in order to reach these 
two lights. Note the radio code first.  

- Pull the rubber cap (high beam, parking light) off the 
headlight housing. 

- Loosen the spring hoop and plug-type connection from 
the high beam bulb and replace the bulb. 

- Grasp the connector socket of the parking light bulb 
and pull it out of the reflector (see Fig. 4). 

Passenger side: 
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Low beam light: 

- Unscrew the attachment screw (Torx 40) from the fuel 
filter (see Fig. 5). 

- Bend the fuel filter carefully to the side. Be careful! In 
the case of vehicles with an air conditioning system, 
mind the air conditioning lines (see Fig. 6). 

- The rubber cap can now be reached by "slim" hands 
(see Fig. 7). The coolant recovery bottle should be 
removed for more room.  

- Loosen the plug-type connection (see Fig. 8, 1) and 
pull the cable bridge off the threaded bolt, off and up (2 
and 3). 

- Remove the attachment nuts from the recovery bottle 
and put this to one side without removing the tube. 

 
Replace high beam, parking and indicator light as 
described for the driver side (without battery removal). 
Replace all removed parts in reverse order.  
Check the lighting system for function. Check and adjust the 
headlight levelling if necessary.  
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Fig. 1 Fig. 2 
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Fig. 3 Fig. 4 

Fig. 5 Fig. 6 

Fig. 7 Fig. 8 
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